
 

Scientists investigate a sperm-boosting
nutrient which may help infertile couples

April 11 2016

Scientists at the University of Sheffield are launching a pioneering study
to investigate if a simple extra nutrient can boost male fertility.

Studies have already shown that lycopene, the red pigment compound
found most readily in sun-ripened tomatoes, can boost sperm count by
up to 70 per cent, as well as conferring other benefits on the male
reproductive system.

Researchers led by Allan Pacey, Professor of Andrology, and Dr
Elizabeth Williams, Senior Lecturer in Human Nutrition, at the
University's Department of Oncology and Human Metabolism are
launching a 12-week trial to see if raising blood lycopene levels
improves sperm quality.

It is estimated that one in six couples are unable to conceive – in about
half of cases the problem is caused by poor sperm quality.

Professor Pacey said: "Studies elsewhere in the world have shown that
the antioxidant properties of lycopene seem to have a beneficial effect
on sperm quality and we want to investigate this further.

"Production of sperm takes three months. This study will tell us if
lycopene improves the quality of sperm already in development by
reducing DNA damage, and whether it produces an overall increase in
the number of mature sperm produced overall.
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"There is enough evidence out there to indicate this study is worth doing
and I am cautiously optimistic. If it works in the volunteers we would
then consider testing it in infertile patients."

The initiative follows a similar study led by Ashok Agarwal, director of
the Cleveland Clinic's Center for Reproductive Medicine in the USA,
which indicated lycopene supplementation could raise sperm count by up
to 70 per cent (Durairajanayagam et al. 2014).

A number of other research studies have also shown lycopene may slow
the progression of cancer of the prostate, the gland that makes seminal
fluid.

Dr Williams, who is an expert in designing trials to observe the health
effects of diet, said: "Little work has been done in this area, but if
lycopene has a beneficial effect on the prostate, it is reasonable to think
it might also improve sperm function."

The Sheffield study, which is starting today (11 April), will involve 60
male volunteers aged between 18 and 30.

Half of the volunteers will take two 7mg capsules per day of a highly
absorbable form of lycopene supplement containing lactolycopene while
the other half will take identical dummy capsules.

All volunteers will provide three sperm and blood samples to check
lycopene levels and to see if some individuals absorb lycopene more
readily than others.

The first samples will be taken at the beginning of the study to provide a
baseline measurement for each volunteer. A second set of samples will
be taken six weeks into the study and a third will be taken at the end of
the 12-week period.
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To avoid the risk of bias, neither the volunteers nor the researchers will
know who has received the active capsules and who has received the
dummy treatment, until the results are analysed. Volunteers will not be
given any personal information about their sperm count or potential
fertility.

The over-the-counter lactolycopene supplement, called XY Pro being
used for the study, has been chosen because of previous scientific papers
showing its lycopene formulation is very readily absorbed.

"We don't want XY Pro to be classed as just another health supplement
with vague potential benefits," said Nigel Iskander, spokesman for
Cambridge Nutraceuticals, the Cambridge University spin off which
manufactures XY Pro.

"We know this compound is very beneficial and we are anxious to garner
as much scientific evidence as possible for its use."
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