
 

First randomised trial finds no substantial
difference in risk of acquiring HIV for 3
different forms of contraception
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Microscopic image of an HIV-infected T cell. Credit: NIAID

Previous research has suggested that some contraceptive methods may
increase women's susceptibility to HIV. However, all three forms of
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contraception trialled were safe and highly effective, supporting their
continued and increased access alongside high quality HIV prevention
services.

A randomised trial of more than 7,800 African women found that a type
of contraceptive injection (intramuscular depot medroxyprogesterone
acetate—DMPA-IM) posed no substantially increased risk of HIV
acquisition when compared with a copper intrauterine device (IUD) and
a levonorgestrel (LNG) implant. The results of this first ever randomised
trial in the area, published in The Lancet, counter 30 years of
epidemiology research suggesting a potential association between some
types of contraceptives and risk of acquiring HIV.

"Our randomised trial did not find a substantial difference in HIV risk
among the contraceptive methods evaluated, and all methods were safe
and highly effective at preventing pregnancy," says study co-author
Professor Jared Baeten, University of Washington, USA.

Co-author Professor Helen Rees, Wits Reproductive Health and HIV
Institute, South Africa adds: "These results underscore the importance of
continued and increased access to these three contraceptive methods, as
well as expanded contraceptive choices, complemented by high-quality
HIV and STI prevention services. Women's informed choice in sexual
and reproductive health services is essential. This evidence will enhance
women's contraceptive decision making and assist providers and
policymakers in delivering high-quality, rights-based contraceptive
care."

More than 600,000 new HIV infections occur in African women each
year, and the prevalence of HIV and STIs was high in women studied in
the trial. Co-author Dr. Nelly Mugo, Kenya Medical Research Institute,
Kenya & University of Washington, USA, cautions: "It is important to
note that none of the contraceptive methods that we evaluated was
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designed to be protective against HIV. Our results strongly emphasise
the need for more aggressive HIV and STI prevention and management
efforts for African women, including PrEP and HIV prevention
integrated with contraceptive services."

Although there is substantial unmet need for modern contraception for
women in Africa who do not wish to become pregnant, more than 58
million African women use modern contraceptive methods. Injectable
contraceptive use has increased over the past few decades in Africa, and
in many settings where HIV incidence is high, DMPA-IM is the
predominant contraceptive used.

Past epidemiological, clinical, and laboratory studies have suggested that
DMPA-IM might increase a woman's susceptibility to HIV. However,
these studies have important limitations, and results have been
inconsistent, with some studies finding no increase in HIV incidence
among DMPA-IM users. In March, 2017, WHO released guidance for
the use of DMPA-IM by women at high risk of HIV infection, and the
WHO Medical Eligibility Criteria (MEC) for the contraceptive changed
from a category 1 ("a condition for which there is no restriction for the
use of the contraceptive method") to a category 2 ("a condition where
the advantages of using the method generally outweigh the theoretical or
proven risks"). In July 2019, the results of this new trial (the ECHO trial)
will be reviewed, and a guideline development group will determine
whether or not DMPA-IM will remain at an MEC category 2 or may be
changed.

In addition, use of other highly effective long-acting, reversible
contraceptive methods, such as LNG implants and copper IUDs, is
rapidly increasing in Africa, but related data on HIV risk are sparse.

The ECHO trial aimed to provide robust evidence on both of these
potential risks to inform women's decision making, contraceptive
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counselling, and policy maker and regulatory decisions.

The trial took place across 12 sites in eSwatini, Kenya, South Africa, and
Zambia, and included 7,829 women aged 16-35 years who were seeking
effective contraception. The women were included if they did not have
HIV, agreed to use the contraceptive method for 18 months, and had not
used any of the three contraceptives included for the past 6 months. The
participants were randomly divided into three groups and given DMPA-
IM (2,609 women), the copper IUD (2,607), or the LNG implant
(2,613). The trial was open-label meaning that the participants and their
clinicians knew which contraceptive was being given. The clinicians
informed women in the study that their contraceptive did not protect
against HIV and advised them to also use condoms.

The researchers tracked how many women developed HIV, and any side
effects of the contraception they used.

In total, 7,324 women (94% of all women included) completed their
final, scheduled visit. Throughout the trial there were 397 HIV
infections (3.8% per year) - 143 in the DMPA-IM group, 138 in the
copper IUD group, and 116 in the LNG implant group. The differences
in HIV incidence were not significant across the three groups of women.

The authors note that their study was designed to be able to detect a 50%
increase in HIV risk, but that the trial was not statistically strong enough
to predict increases lower than 30% - which might remain important for
some women at very high HIV risk like those in the study, in terms of
decision making about contraception and HIV prevention.

All three contraceptive methods were well tolerated, with less than 4%
of participants in any group reporting any serious adverse event (2%, 49
women in the DMPA-IM group, 4%, 92 women in the copper IUD
group, and 3%, 78 women in the LNG implant group) and less than 9%
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reporting adverse events resulting in method discontinuation (4%, 109
women in the DMPA-IM group, 8%, 218 women in the copper IUD
group, and 9%, 226 women in the LNG implant group). Reasons for
discontinuing contraceptive use were mostly due to common side effects
of the contraceptive.

In addition, all three contraceptives were highly effective, with
approximately 1% or less of women getting pregnant while using the
contraceptive they were assigned to continuously for one year, however
the injection and the implant had lower pregnancy incidence than the
copper IUD. The majority of pregnancies (71%, 181 pregnancies)
occurred after women discontinued their assigned contraceptive, and
overall there were 255 pregnancies in the trial.

The authors note that their findings cannot be generalised to other types
of contraceptives, and do not compare against if no contraceptive is
used.

They note some limitations, including that although self-reported use of
DMPA-IM during the 6 months before enrolment was an exclusion
criterion, approximately 13% of women in the study were likely to have
used it beforehand based on blood tests showing existing levels of the
contraceptive. The authors note that this is a similar level as seen in past
studies.

Writing in a linked Comment, Lisa Miyako Noguchi, Johns Hopkins
University, USA, says: "Although ECHO results are largely reassuring
for contraceptive methods included in the trial, a substantial unfinished
agenda remains to meet the range of needs of those at risk for unplanned
pregnancy and HIV infection, including stronger global and national
commitments and accountability for informed choice for family
planning and HIV prevention and treatment. Many factors are driving
unacceptably high rates of HIV acquisition in young women, but we
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have good reasons to believe that contraception is not one of them."

  More information: Khatija Ahmed et al, HIV incidence among
women using intramuscular depot medroxyprogesterone acetate, a
copper intrauterine device, or a levonorgestrel implant for contraception:
a randomised, multicentre, open-label trial, The Lancet (2019). DOI:
10.1016/S0140-6736(19)31288-7
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